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Apartment in Calanova Golf Reference: R5044117

Bedrooms: 3 Bathrooms: 2 M² Build size: 247 Price: 749,000 €
Status: Sale Property Type: Apartment Parking places: by request M² Plot Size:



Overview:Elegant apartment with incredible sea views. Upon entering this charming luxury apartment, you are
greeted by a welcoming hall space, already showing seaview, that invites you to explore. To your right, a hallway
takes you to a bathroom and two large double bedrooms, perfect for resting and relaxing. Both bedrooms have
built-in wardrobes and have access to a large common terrace, ideal for enjoying the fresh air and views. As you
move forward, you will find a modern, fully equipped kitchen, which has an elegant grand island that separates it
from the bright living-dining room. From here, you can delight in stunning sea views while you enjoy your meals or
simply relax. But that's not all, from the bright open plan living room you have access to a spectacular private
terrace which includes a swimming pool - imagine the fun and relaxing moments you can enjoy here. To the left of
the living room is the main bedroom, a true refuge that has en-suite walk-through wardrobes and private bathroom,
sea views and direct access to the terrace. It is the perfect place to disconnect and enjoy the tranquility. The entire
flat has underfloor heating, heat pump, alarm system and video intercom, blinds and awnings covering the entire
terrace. All rooms can be individually controlled by the Airzone home automation system. This apartment also
includes two underground parking spaces with easy access to the elevator and a large storage room, giving you all
the comfort you need. The urbanization offers a range of facilities to complement this fantastic lifestyle. You can
enjoy a communal infinity swimming pool, an indoor heated pool, sauna, Turkish bath, a well-equipped gym to keep
you active, a golf simulator so you can practice your swing without leaving home and a gastrobar. This elegant
apartment invites you to enjoy the Mediterranean climate and panoramic views. Don't miss the opportunity to live
this unique experience! Contact us today to schedule a visit and make your dreams of seaside luxury and comfort
come true. Welcome to the captivating area of Cala de Mijas, nestled in the picturesque hills and Calanova Golf,
perched on the border of Mijas and Marbella. This idyllic location offers a serene and tranquil environment, perfect
for those seeking tranquility. Just a short drive away, you will discover a variety of lovely cafes, shops, restaurants
and supermarkets, ensuring that all your needs are met in maximum convenience. Strategically located, Calanova
Golf offers easy access to both Marbella and Malaga. The proximity to the motorway ensures fast and comfortable
transport, with Malaga airport just 30 minutes away. If you fancy more adventure, Fuengirola awaits you just 15
minutes away, offering kilometers of sandy beaches and a multitude of services to satisfy all your needs. Likewise,
Marbella attracts with its famous dining and shopping options, perfect for enjoying the good things in life. For golf
enthusiasts, La Cala de Mijas is a golfer's paradise with three different golf clubs within 5 to 15 minutes drive. If you
prefer other sporting activities, there is a gym and two tennis and padel clubs just 5 minutes away, ensuring plenty
of options to keep you active and entertained. Whether you are looking for relaxation or an enchanting adventure,
La Cala de Mijas is the perfect destination, offering a harmonious combination of natural beauty, convenient
amenities and easy access to nearby attractions.

Features:

Pool, Air conditioning, Sea views, Mountain views, Private garden, Lift, None, Alarm system, 24H Security, Parking,
None


